
CITY OF SAMMAMISH
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA

REGULAR MEETING
MAY 3, 2000

PRIOR TO THE REGULAR MEETING, BEGINNING AT
6:30 P.M., REPRESENTATIVES OF THE YMCA AND CITY
OFFICIALS WILL BRIEF THE COUNCIL ON THEIR
RECENT TRIP TO TOUR THE SHERWOOD, OREGON
JOINT YMCA/CITY FACILITY AND PROGRAMS

Wednesday, May 3, 2000, 7:30 p.m., 486 228"‘Ave. N.E., City Hall Chambers

CALL TO ORDER

ROLL CALL/PLEDGE

INTRODUCTION OF SPECIAL GUESTS AND PRESENTATIONS

1. Approval of Agenda

2. Public Comment (For members of the public to speak to the Council regarding items n_ot_on the agenda.
Please limit remarks to three minutes)

3. Consent Calendar

21) Claims for the period ending April 28, 2000 in amount of $79,510.86.
b) Payroll for period April 1-15, 2000 in amount of $42,615.64.
e) Minutes of Regular Council Meeting April 5, 2000.

4. New Business

a) Ordinance No. 02000-58: Amending Building Code To Reference
Penalties for Fire Lane Violations

b) Ordinance No. O2000-64: Amending Sammamish Criminal Code to
Include Penalties for Fire Lane Violations





Council and Committee Reports

City Manager and Staff Reports
a) Police Officer of Quarter and Year

Public Comments

Executive Session — Litigation

Adjourn





CITY COUNCIL ROLL CALL

Mayor Jack Barry

Deputy Mayor Troy Romero

PhilDyer

Don Gerend

Ron Haworth

KathleenHuckabay if 5

Kenneth Kilroy /





CITY COUNCIL VOICE VOTE

Kilroy Romero Barry





)lV3dS LON J.)-lV3dS morxmooMm HSIWVWWVS.LN9\/\/WOO ’Jl’72V)<t





Q? onmmiau?mmr

4 L. X. .
xffiwx an.. .
x

..
.31 ‘ r a

,3

>..::.mm_ om...» wax
a?m?nm

H,E:nm_Uammmz~§.::.$

dm=w=%E:E_E8. m=o_=._am.m_.8€3a
SE5 3.2%..“ macaw
$28 am.._.a8.: o\..3. :.:.mclmmummnmoimmaoS. 85B:=mQ
mai?m Em:._.».._.a mosowwacwm
Qo=£.a=% 5.25 <aEo_mmE..QE. $.35.
mam:_w<a_3. 3.3.2.3 mooammBmummwaoi
w2_8:.§.=._.a ac §=E...m B» anno .E.§& 3.8 ..S%:_

E.a...§$ cvowmmanmcaamm
H..:n_a main .§:.§§a SHE: 85:EEQ
Qa:2.w=%<c_==8m m..§.-~m.a8 <oEo_amEw%
Qa=2.m=«.3E :38 $333 _o».?»E.= F58
mm=m_a.._m=o£8: &.....&..= in. maoo=:==o:m_amA:..= E5 2. m-_m=¢

E.8..E_ ocE=5=_< moo:aammmsm
gE-Ecow .2.» 3:5 unccoiwwooommma=2.u__%w=c€2_

w2§.:.§. §=:_._& =m=u=%$..<& 3. mE2§=a

as 28 5:»: 3.3.. 3 $3.2. o?m?a Ema 2. m_5:E£.

>323 w1E»Q wssomcs Juldammms
Uammmswmcu m_§%

* 2:5
w1:n€u_ 733:? m?éam 36.. E5. :3 .3 S.

>1m1m_ >n8EEcmm$m =:.c:m_.33 Qumanau
vagaau E&w= oo=8~.m

.E:.o=m~.=5<@~=@§n S. :.§_a

gmuow>..81m_ Oousmna 3 v1.86». >~.81m_m 8 8 am
w?wuna €38: BoE=Qea

Fun mooomw

H *
.

Oc=mn8.. FEE aonomm82¢ mBcS.3.::5: 3 8 mm
>..81m_ awn...” Scrum?

zam_._..:,_§a Ocsscomsm822:.» E8
*

8 3.

Oc=an8_. =...E._5::.o% _.m_o€

m2.<8 Eng unnomm

mmi. ._.mo_..

ma?am E9: alum
®a=S.»=%~.8o-8.25 <aEo_8Ew%
mEm_¢._w=oaver.=..§._§ SE. 3. £32: nouanaocm_am..2:.: Fa»
_..a8E»= 5.38 :m:w=%m2.<oarmmE9<m=a
my 2% :25: 32%

_.saga c?m?o 5.5 S. mroui?.
m2.<8 E9: 33
baa. .55: mucosa
n2.a%..a§a won33¢ omriam
Qo=2.u=wués <oEa_amEm%8. 5%
_.2§E§ 58:38 =m=u=w$22. cwmEo€w=a S. m_S=E2.

E... E8 5:»: 3.5:.
_.

552.2. 2%? .35 S. m_5=E2.

2%
__

B8

m_:=BmQ





Q? E. mm:::§:mm_. >_.81m_ n_5..%§._._:§ m::.:::.%
>_.81:_ 5.::uQ 5:§§. Uommm:I.1Hv._:o:_Uammm::§:=§

Uammm:a:o: mcaoam
22.:

w1:o€m_ §oE=Q m2.<2_ 32. 5:2 :3 3 2. 92:5. .:===u:m.:§_.._8 ._...8€m%m
>_.$1w_ >no3:_:c&:om $:.o:m_. :.§ 0328.. :53 253......”wuaoam

umgma: :3»: 8:83 m..._.§ mmm:Enw:ne\..3. 33 o1mm:m::moim?a 3. 8:.E::mQ
.E:.o:m=_:c<2:a:» 2 :.:o_6 m2.§ Em:3.? ma:S.:3_.m

Qa:2.m=u.5.25 <mEn_8E3. S. mwomamw
:_._n_._m<a_3. 33.2.? monamm:5:wma:.a:»
:....._8:.§<_% an §_.__=_._a :5 cama.§.»§_ 3:: 3:92»

25:8. >..81:_
,

Oc::a2m 8 ~u1:o€w_>..81&m
.

8 3 Am J<_2§.»8 £u2.mn:m 2.3%
35:8 .538: :5E=Q u:a Hnzormm2.<o ._aa=a_._..=mSHE: 2=:_:::mQ

_m:: monmmm Qa:2.m__%<c_E:om m.2..-~m...8<oEo_omE3.
Oa:2.w=%SE :36 mauwu?a_&.:_:. _m:8

mm:m_m-_m:mawn:Ewwamc:$5: maao::::c:m_om.::.: _m:oS. m.._§...

8.81% 8:=:c:_«. maa: mammma
§E-Eaow 5.: =:.:m_:.c_:2.Q woommmma:2.w=%m=c€2_

3.2.1»: m..§_Eam :m:u=wma?a: 3. m_.a2§=a

Eu 3% :25: $.22. G €Em:2_ oanmmam_m:a3. m_5:E2.

Oo=ao3.. ESE wooamm525 ::uo3::a 9:: Nm8 mm m?émm E9: .13
>_.81m_ 53¢ ~:cE=Q Go:E.u=%~.2a-:..25 <wEn_amEm%

mm:m_a._m:aman:Eamnno: £5: 8. £25.: oo:::=c:m_o_,.?:=.: _m:m
w2§=.§_ m8=Eom:m=m=%m?éaa cwmE9§=a

an E8 :25: 5.3.. 5 252.2. c?m?m _.::a E. mro=E2.
2amE§_32_ Oo::mo::m:o2<o_._1:3 2. B. maiam E8: alum

Oc=on8_. :ommEuS._5o._m 3...: Ho? swam:3.8%
m2.<8 :5: manamm Oo:mE2.amc:m m2.3.? ou_:::m

Ga:2.:=%92... <mEe_8Em%S. Ema
w2_a3..=. mmn?mam=m=a=u.:22. 3. m5m€:=a E. m_5:E2.

:5}; :m:w=mS.<2_ 3 ..<Ea:ma ccnmia 5:» E. m_5:E2.

ma; ._.mo: _<_m<4..88





Q? cmmmszs?imr >..31m_O_§_.»£a1m:nm m:===m=.%
1

>_.81w_
_
wa?aww3..§§. Uammmu.—.E:n»_ Ummmms_§.:_..$

dammmuwncs mumonm
ZEVE

w1=n€m_ 3oE_5. mm?aa36.. Eng =mm S S. dm=w=%5:55am. §_=.§ mmuom?uwm
>..81u_ >n8ESc&:am ::.o:m_.alum O..am8.. Emmr?.ocawmnsmmwaamm

raga»: =3»: om=8..m m2.§ am=:._8a .3 3, «lam clmmswasmc?mmma3. ooBE:EQ
5.25.. So<aE2n 2 Séorm m2.<mmEm::.a.momouaawncnm

Dosmnmuw3.25 <aEo_mmEm%S. mnmmmow
w?mr.95. 3. cuowmaucoammBwumma?mi

. w¢%m:.§.§... Ea mimmamH5 anmo.m~.m8n~35 ..S%§

2:59. >..81u_ 02:53 8 w1=o:um_>..81a_m mo8 am 32.33 cuaummsmmcaoam
w?waaa .528: :5E=Q Ea Hwanwmma?a ._8m=a§_m 25:: 8ES:=mQ

.35 mnnmmm Qo=2.w=%<c_=Eam m.8.Em.m8<oEo_omEw%
Qm=2.m__%SE :36 mauwwmaa_o:.2=.= 5:8
m§m_¢-_§... nan:Euaoaou SE. manoamszcsmE..:..... Sun S. m-_a:m

E.81w_ oo§Bc=_% mam:aammmsm
33.28» am«Sim _:.owo_.J. mnoammma=2.w=%»__§a

_.2_§_.§. ».§_._=.§ :m:w=%m?doa 3. mawi?wm

* ll

En £8 :25: main: U £5289 2:3? :5» S. m_E=E9.

I.O|c=ao8_. FEE monamm5:8 rscoimun9»: mm8 mm m2.§ 58: :.:.m
.>_.81w_ QmmmoBoE=Q Qmaauwnw~..§.-S...8 <aEn_amEm%

mmumrimamawn:Eamnnca £5» 2. $385 ocumuaosm_om?n:_.= ~35
uuaaamcmwsma_._§.am :m=w=%32% 6%ma...§=a

wx aom:m:m=32$
..saaaa cimmamSun S. mrc:E$.

zamzazsa Ocuumomum:83; 58 mm3. m2.<omSow. :.€m
Oc=oo8_. =am_._8_._.8% wins. ?cé anmmmnmuaaam

m2.§ En: mnnmmm Ooam?onwmcsm mom2.3? owraum
Qa=2.m=u.925 <oEn_omE3.S. _amm

woaammlus§_.__S8 :m=~=u.m?éon 3 m53<m_wm S. m.§._%..

wwnm?am=m:m«_m?mao_.<om3. £33.. oim?m _w=m3. mwc:E2.

mun:Awe: §m< 4.B8





Q? % mu=.=:m::m_.

>35».

Uammmssmcs

Awlaaww5:23:

w1=n€m_

_
§oE=Q mains 35. .35 :3

>..81w_ >onoEEcam8m =_..2_m__alum n..$§.

S38: :3»: 8:83
,:.:..=n_.Bo<aBm:» 3. =.=..._a

73:8. >2a1m_ Ocsuooa 8 w1=o€m_>..81u_m .3 8 3
wiwsoo cogaaa Soda? Ea

.35 mnommw

Oc=mo8.. 5.5 mnowmm=83 mawc?wsn:5: mm8 mm
>..81w_ 33.5 Bazma

.
2...E._:..._.2a

,

Ocssanmam=3§.w E8 8 E.

Oc=no8_. .§m_._8.._.8% _.o_o€

m?éom ~35 monamm

mma.«mo:

>1a1m_ n_:§§:._:_._a m:BEm..%

aE.§._ U85: m§=§

dm:m=v.5:555». §_=._a mwaaéwwm
?mmrmn25%....» mumaam
m2.<om2._m=_.a8=.¢\c $.13 clmmswmum3.85» S. ooEB:EQ
mmiamEm:s??n mauowmqcwm
Do=8.m=%5.25 <mEo_mmEwu.S. mwamnmw
Emma_a<a_3. 3.3.9.? mnoammEwswmm?ann
$%:..§<_._.a an §_._=.§ :5 camo 2.32. ~35 wawaéw

S..%:§ cwowmanmmwammm
.H_.:n_a ma?a .§a.§§a 25:: 8=:::EQ
Q¢=2.u=% <c_=:.am m.25-~m.c2.<mEo_omEm%
Oa=2.u:%25 52a mauwnmao_&.?2=.= 5:8
mm=m_a-_»=oawn:&:§_.§. 3:: maocsmuccsm_a,.3=~= Sun S. m-_w=o

3.81». oc::=c=_% mow:mammmzm
§E-_u_caw .24 E35 m=.3§.Q moaammmo=2.w:u.»__2§_

w&§_+»= _.§=E8 =m=u=%$22. 3. mE¢€w__a

En £8 5:»: %_.<&
_.

§._.§§_ 253» 3.8 B. m_5=E2.

m2.§ Sam. .13
®w=E.m=%~.8o-:..8.. <aEo_omEm%
mm=m_o._»=oown:Enonmoa $5. 2. €E5:» ocamnseum_&.:__.= 5:»

w2§..._._§ ..§_.__:§ :m=m=%m?émm cwmEo$§=G

wmo£8 5:»: m?éaa
_.saga cca?m .88 S. mros??.

m2.<omSew. :.€m
H53 gnaw:%$%
Ocummmawamcsm.3 35.5 owrism
Go:9.mE\ysz. <oEo_amEm%3. Emu
w2§:.§= §=_._.§.. =m:m=%:22. 3. mE2<w__a E. m_5:ES.

En 28 5:»: m?éoa U saga o?m?a .88 E. mrc:E2.

:3 A.88





Q? E. mwi?mimmr

>1a1w_

Uammmummos
$15»? m=.§_.a=

w1=n€u_ §oE=Q m£.<.& 36.. Fan :3

>_.$1a_O_§..a2a1m:nm m::E5..%

._,E:oa_ U85: m§=.§

dm:a=v.5:555? 5958 ._.~.oa€3a

m2.<mmmmmimnwun.x.@313 clmmsmmsmczar? 3. 855:3?

_..aa._.§.:.a 2» $9.38 :5 9.. mo mu?aa $.25 acacia

mm=m_¢._m=aawn:?amomcs«<5. maoc=a=:c:m53:3 3:8 2. m.._m=o

§E..Ecn_1a_..n 3...; 3.35.? uooammmo=2.»=%m=o€2_

_.2§=.§. ..§=aa :m:m=w32% 3 mEa€u=a

w_.a%§. :m=m=v.w?éom UM252.2. 9:mEa Esa S. m_5=E2.

mm=u_a-_a=oowe:Euaomca £5. 3. £25.: oosmuaocm_m».T?:.= Ema
_.2§i».. _.wn=58 :m=a=%§.<& cwmE2<w=a

93.8 :25: m?éaa
_.

43.3% o?maa Fan 2. m_8=E2.

waaomtmwsaaaa =m=u=v.§.<& 3 m?oi?wm S. m_S=EE.

En £8 :25: m2.<2~3 <..E¢=2_ 253» 5.8 E. m_5:E2.

>..81w_ >nnoEEo&.8m =:.c=m__3&5 Q_.ma8_. Ems? cuowuaum:52:
.825? 5.3»: 8=8_.m

.E:.c:m_. Bc<m=§: am3:26 maiam Em:Emma mmsmn?awm
Oa=a_.m=%5.25 <mEo_8Em%E. mno??.
Emma_a<a_an_:.£.o..Q aooommEm=wmaBa=.

2==E. >~.81m_ Ocssannm8 w1=n€m_>1o1m_m 8 3 3 S..._2§... cwauunammagma
w?wsoa .538: EoE=Q Ea Hwsowmma?a .§a_.§..a 23:: oc=::==5.

.33 unowmm Qa=2.m=%<o_:Eam .u...§.-~m.25 <oEo_8Ew%
Do=2.v__v.3: E56 macmnuno_om.E..= Eng

8.81% 8===o=_%mam:aommmum

0o=mo8.. FEE mnoomm=83 :=_§.§: 9»: mm8 mm m?éam E3: .13
>..81u_ 33¢ :5E=Q Dm:E.m__%~...8-S.25 <aEo_8Em%

zamE§._§a Oassoomam=.§s.% E8 8 S. mo?am_oow:1wm
Oc=on8~. .§mE§.__8% 5%. ~58 %am..3.8%

m2.§ 5:9 wonamm n..§%_.»%a 3.. namenariam
Oa=2.a=u.P25 <mEo_omEm%E. Ema

mun:._.wo: 2.3 e 88





Q? 3. mw?aaammr

. womamamivmoan ..§=:§.. Ba cmwe sang _._.oE ..s§§

>1a1m_O_.§.ao$1mmnm m:=:=uJ.

dm:m=%B:==m=m.=a_=.§ _...8§€

m2.<ammmmsmmnwi..\..cw~13 olmmsmanmoanm?a3. n2=E:EQ

Qm=E.m=%3.25 <aEn_mmEw%8. mnounaw
man:.96. E. cnowo?wmoowmmEauwma?ci

Hnzowmm2.<a .§.§ao=m 25:: oc5§:EQ

Da=2.w=%<o_:=8m m.25-~m.2s<oEo_8Emv.
Da=2,w=%SE :93 mouuwnea_am3:_.= 5:8
mm=m_a-_m=mnun:Eamomou3:: manoimuzczm _o_..?2=.= Ema 9. 3%;

2.81% oE=:.o=_%mow:aommmsm
2—E-EcnwEm 3:45 ~:.cu2.Q woommmma=m..u=v.m=c€£_

w2§=.§. _.§._E§ :m=m=v.$22. 3 mEo€m=G

wmovimm:m:w=M$23 5 saga ..=§._% 5.8 E. m_8:E2.

>3a1w_ w1EmJ~3_.§_.§.

_
Uammmu

_
H%Enm_Uammmsm§=..$

u%._m=£_._.:. muaaam
.|.

9:43
_.:_.a_.»_ 3cE_5. m?émm 96.. Fan :8 3 2.

>_.81w_ >nnoEEo&:am ::.c=m:alum 0.632. mmmrmncuawwmsmmumamm
e228: :3»: no?anm

.:.3=m_. =3<mBa=n 3. 38.6 m?adm Em:.§m.a ma=2.m8_.m

358. >~.81m_
..

Ocuumonm8 w1=n€w_>_.81m_m 2. 3 am 332.28 oumwmanmmuommm
w?unow wagon: =5E=Q ea

55. anommm

Tl

_
A

Oa=oo3~. 5:3 wanomm=88 mBuo3...::3»: pm8 mm maiam E8: alum
>_.81m_ 3.3a Sosa?

IL

zanuceéea Oonamnmsm.§§.,w E8 8 E. maiam Sn». 3.?
no=on8.. .§m_.€_._.8% vies. boé swam:3.8%

maiam .35 wnnnmm

mma.._.mo:

. wmmmmam:m:u=Mm?éoa 3 §._%..& o:$Em Fun 2. m—5:E2.

02.255. ~.=8-:....8 <aEo_amE..Q
mm=m_?_w=aown:Enmomoa25” 3. 1555 naumusazm_&.?nE.= Ema

_
waaomawmmum?maa =m=m=%m?dmm 3 a%§.=a

En £8 :25: m?émm U 2582. S:mEo .35 E. m_E=E2.

o..=a._§&...a 3.. 2.»? §_.a=m
Go=2.m__w9.25 <mEo_omE3\E. Ema
v2.8.1»: §_.__=§ =m=m=v.3.42. 6%mE9§=a S. m_5=E2.

:3 .7B8





Ruth Muller

From: Mike Wilson
Sent: Thursday, April 20, 2000 5:52 PM
To: 'NaiNmoW
Cc: Ruth Muller
Subject: RE: Next Step

Neil,

Don, Kathy and I met the other day to discuss our trip and process for
introducing to the city officials findings and recommendations. It was
our concensus that we organize a group meeting of city council members,
park commissioners and "Y" folks to discuss our trip to Sherwood and our
next steps. The ball is in our court to coordinate such a meeting.

I will ask Ruth Muller our City Clerk to arrange such a meeting. Thanks Qyg?i
for your interest and support. yyiw

Michael

—-———Original Message———-~
From: Neil Nicoll [mailto:NNicoll@SEATTL3YMCA.org]
Sent: Thursday, April 20, 2000 1:00 PM
To: 'mwilson@ci.sammamish.wa.us’

Cc: Marcia Isenberger
Subject: Next Step

Just checking to see if you have a feel yet for a date to get together
on
our next steps? I will be out of town May lO—l2 if it waits that long.
Otherwise I am around.





Len & SallyMattson
%

V

From: Len & Sally Mattson <LenSally@Mattson.net>
To: Mayor Jack Barry &City Council<webmastar@cityofsarnmamlsh.net>
Sent: Wednesday, May 03, 2000 4:52 PM
Subject: Hardship

From: Len Mattson, 19546 SE 24th way, 98029, which has been our residence
since 1968.
Approximately 3 years ago and after rotator cuff and lower back surgery it
became apparent that we needed to sell our property and purchase something
smaller and with less yard work. The developer of Sherbrooke approached us
to purchase our property and after several months of negotiation an
agreement was reached. But right before the final signing the water
moratorium was put into effect. and they backed out. We were told by King
Co. that the property could not be divided without water and then told by
the water district we would have to apply for water certificates by lottery
which we have done every quarter since. Last quarter we were awarded our
certificates and we again looked forward to the sale of our property. After
one week an agreement was reached and signed. On April4th, our attorney,
Tom Whittington, on our behalf, wrote to the council regarding our hardship
and the building moratorium. On April 11th we appeared before a working
session of the council, with only one council member in attendance at start
time. City employee Mat Mathes stated that our hardship had all
the characteristic as others granted with two exceptions, (1) we had not
yet paid for our certificates and (2) our hardship was larger than any other
granted, thus the city would be on new ground. Councilperson Huckabay
decided that we didn't have a hardship since we had not paid and even then
we would have six months before it actually became a hardship. We then
submitted a letter of request to be heard at the fullcouncil meeting April
19th. When we arrived for the meeting, we were not included in the agenda.
in this letter we explained why we had not yet paid fees, reason being we
had until the 21st of April,and did not want to pay until after the
hardship was granted. Also it was pointed out that nowhere in the moratorium
hardship is their anything about the size of the project. The ability or
inability of the city to process said request should not constitute a new
hardship for the property owner. Per your employee Mat Mathes, we have met
qualifications and he recommended approval. During the break I asked Ms.
Huckabay ifour hardship would be discussed during the meeting. She said No,
and of conversation. After the council had approved other hardships,
Councilman Ron Haworth brought to the attention the letter of the Mattson's,
and that it had deadline date on it. One of the other council members asked
if the moratorium said anything about numbers. Also Mayor Barry made
favorable comments in our behalf, but Ms. Huckabay stated the committee,
she. had looked at the request and that their was no hardship because funds
had not been paid and even then their would be six months before it became
a real hardship. She also stated that the committee would again review at
the next
working session. Another letter was sent requesting our hardship be placed

5/3/00

<./r ,

ex





on the agenda. We also asked that if not on the agenda to fax us back
accordingly. We did not get a fax so expected to be on the agenda. At that
meeting, Councilman Phil Dyer stated that their would only be one item on
the agenda relating to Beaver Lake. He said he knew that their was another
party in attendance that needed answers, but that they did not have the
time. Said
something about density. T0 date we have had no success working with the
hardship committee. They seem to be to busy to fax you back about not being
on the agenda, nor can they give you the curiosity of an explanation other
than NO. Iwould ask the fullcouncil to review my hardship. The water
certificates are nowpaid for. Nowhere in the building moratorium is numbers
mentioned nor have i asked for a number. Granting a hardship does not
guarantee anything other than the right to proceed with an application. Why
have a hardship clause if the committee wants to resolve the density zoning
problems first.
i do have a sale for the property, l have excepted earnest money and the
water certificates have been paid for. i intend not to lose this sale
because of the city's inability to process an application. I've already
contacted a land use attorney with intentions to recovery monies lost if
buyer backs out because of the city being on new ground and not knowing how
to proceed. City Employee Mat lvlathes has stated that are hardship has all
the characteristic as others granted We feel we should not be discriminated
against because of the number of potential lots. Thank you for your
consideration. Len Mattson

Page 2 of 2

5/3/00



...:_.



CITY OF SAMMAMISH
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA

REGULAR MEETING
MAY 3, 2000

PRIOR TO THE REGULAR MEETING, BEGINNING AT
6:30 P.M., REPRESENTATIVES OF THE YMCA AND CITY
OFFICIALS WILL BRIEF THE COUNCIL ON THEIR
RECENT TRIP TO TOUR THE SHERWOOD, OREGON
JOINT YMCA/CITY FACILITY AND PROGRAMS

Wednesday, May 3, 2000, 7:30 p.m., 486 228*”Ave. N.E., City Hall Chambers

CALL TO ORDER

ROLL CALL/PLEDGE

INTRODUCTION OF SPECIAL GUESTS AND PRESENTATIONS

1. ,/Approvalof Agenda
/f,

2. aV//Public COIIlIIl€llt (For members of the public to speak to the Council regarding items £151on the agenda.
Please limit remarks to three minutes)

3. mwéonsentCalendar

a) Claims for the period ending April 28, 2000 in amount of $79,510.86.
b) Payroll for period April 1-15, 2000 in amount of $42,615.64.
c) Minutes of Regular Council Meeting April 5, 2000.

4. NewBusiness

1,1a) Ordinance No. O2000-58: Amending Building Code To Reference
” Penalties for Fire Lane Violations

R
fin)OrdinanceNo. 02000-64: Amending Sammamish Criminal Code to

0”" Include Penalties for Fire Lane Violations





Council and Committee Reports

City Manager and Staff Reports
a) Police Officer of Quarter and Year

Public Comments

Executive Session —— Litigation

Adjourn





83 oot._EEoo mo?oyos? E3 dooman $3.44

m~UZ<?U OH eomambm my? mmzi DZ< mm,3d UZHHHHS

WAREAOM

Hm an an
23:95 2.5 22.5.20

Na

woqzouumosvomE?mzm
56 2.33 wiam Eaam

=s? 5mU\Enxm—.550 uac?com

EB 23.... 5.650 awn£9

mum£5 .56 92 amm?a??am

b_U\EEoU $5? .EmMm~wniao? ncmmmm??cvcom

wno?com «£3.
:a cmuwcmum

ea an Sum .5... 85 a. 91$ an 85
S

:3 b6
.w.£=.3 «SEA

.E§nm.w.~?
5a 85.23

am

=n? 6
EU

.w.5Emea cmum

EE €232
E?cnv Q3263

.EEcU ea .56

:o:=cU 5&3

S a
U2 :o::cD
55 8.53

E5 Esf?m
52» an 25
ooannwman cmnm
min $0 3 =4

><nm:e<m ><Em,._ ><:mm::,.. ><nmmznm>> ><GmHDH ><QZO2 ><nz:m

m<nzmA<u AHVZDOU FED mm~2<22<m
25 Q2





><amP~<m

S

HUZ<EU OH eumambm :4 $.25. 97?» mm....<nUZE.

3
.32 =o::oD
b6 5.53.
EEOC 5;?

as =5 2%
in Eu 3 __<

3 2
=aE _D

nimmombzzm
=u:=cU Emcmé in 56?:

=::cU 395:
.:::oU an acne

2

=aE
563.2 .32

.m.5Emea cmum
NH

2:802
:o::oU an emu»

?n §2:£

uz?mong?mxmn

=2; 56 3 =4 Em an 22:

><Q-E .%<QmMDEH ><nmmzmmB ><nmmBa

m<:zmq<u AHUZDOU P50 =m=>222<m
as MZDH

3

in
«:Emo:D\E8nm

oona?m an emum wgman cons mamea 23.
wonaaada?m =a? £033 in m:U\o:aA

wi Eu 3:: §5mo:U\E§§ ws?moavx?amm
mumEa sex:

WANQZOE

83 oo:_EEoo _§s8,22m =§ .83 ,3 =&<

HHS

=aE EMU
:c_mm_E:SU com
Q 5:3 an =3

MUEENA

><nz:m





am

NN

B

%<DMDH.<m

83 oo:.E.Eoo __8=oo,2§ ?x doom"3 =E<

m—UZ<~.HUOH eumambm :4 mmzi DZ< mm—.H<QUZF-LHMEZ

ENE55
Ezmmom.€Em

moazcvan cmé

35
...._.82

EE aazso an 92.
£9 - wascw: Suaasu ass
.w.5Emea cmnm ash macoum

ii 55 2 ac
S

{

‘

><Qm-Dm,H

Em .35
ucmmmm??cvcom
a.2.3 ea :3

3mm

.
:3 ~35

32:0 m£o>oG
.:::cU an .55

:9 Q0
Ezmmomzcsum

:o::cU an emé

:23

watooz
:o::aU Em cmuh

oot_EEeU

ooza?m ea cmum
:«H 56 E =<

><Q~AOE

m

WANQZOE><amm5,..><B~E ><nmmzmm>>

m<:zmE<u AHUZDOO FED mm~2<22<m
25. ,,.AD;_.





m?uo?.?®£OmH..Hm©G®~$O\?O§OO\H®=5§E

Su? m :55 E500
mi 8 qoumxocsmHow$58 aos?omom

UEHHHS UZHHHHS zoammm HHHHHSSOD Sari <QZHU< Ham:
x=DZDOU ‘HD7500 >QDH.m AHVZDOU
5:50am q?omam ‘HD7500

2§§. _.:_.§m





m8om.vonomn-umw8oEo\mo8oo\Ho=d8>m

C.)

bwio>Om?bmuswm

mo_u>oQ.88oU wm?momAmmmmv805$ wadhm«modem omnsm

Q33 3958 SE5

0U

Eooiou? ZNFH QMNQmam

U

momomom~85 o>wm8o:oE8oU

U

8o82m omD??md

\€Bm\aoEm8wo<bbmo?
N02 _m.:5.mZov?q Hozwom.o=&<880 O3

O0

82259 .8800 8o88.Sm aommrw

bmwqsomm8< m88§E

U

@2059 .8800
Q0

mo_o>oQ.8800

HHHEIZEOU SW: <nzmw<
AHVZDOU

UZHHHHE UZHHHHE zommmmm
ANVZDOU A~UZ3OU >825
m?summ q<5mEm A~DZDOU

m~H<DHOG EENE. _.§>,..m





made:.venom"-En:2wo\:oa:oo\Ho=:§n\E

wz?mmz UZHHHHS zoammm m—H,HH=Z2OU EHHH <QZHU<
‘HD7500 QHUZDOU VQDHM AHUZDOU
5:50am q?ummm AHVZDOU

sis: Ezm





m?ox.venomn-HmvqoEo\moc5oo\$::Qu>m

UEHHH2 UZHHHME zoammm MEHHHEEOO EMMA<QZHU<
a?UZDOU 1307500 K55 ‘HUZDOU
M4430: A<~UmEm ‘HD7500

2.3%.. .§_.Em





in
II!

m?om.woaomn-HmucoEo\moa:oo\.Hos:::\E

m

HHHHUZEOU
a=UZDOO

>5

BA

23

25

BA

3m

3m

>3

25

>3

>5

RE

Iom?oqmhm Eoog?z

Ear: <:zmw<zoammmUZHHHMEZ UZHHHH2
‘HD7500 AHUZDOU wnbem
-<ADUm~m q?ummm w=UZDOU

EH43 MDQ aemai. Eésm





ClTY OF‘ SAMMAMISH
704 228TH AVENUE N. E. - PMB 491
SAMMAMISH, WASHINGTON 98053

CHECK REGISTER
DATE: MAY 3,2000

CHECK Puchase
NUMBER Order No. VENDOR DESCRIPTION CHECK DATE AMOUNT

1825 King County Treasury Drainage/SWM/Storm Retention Taxes 4/24/00 $1,165.12
1826 State of Wa Dept of Revenue Qtrly Taxes - 1st Qtr 2000 4/24/00 $3,015.84
1827 Regency Realty City Hall Lease - May, 2000 4/27/00 $14,407.00
2058 2 Waldron Resources lnterim Staff — Asst to City Mgr 5/3/O0 $1,218.75
2059 8 The News Tribune Personnel Ads 5/3/00 $483.96

2060 14 Smart Wireless Cell Phones Police Station 5/3/00 $303.87
2061 12 Seattle Times Personnel Ads 5/3/00 $666.90

2062 7 Puget Sound Energy Electric Bill 5/3/00 $250.83

2063 22 Parrish Communications Reterminate Cables 5/3/00 $277.04

2064 26 Nova Norton Software 5/3/00 $287.32

2065 29 Nat Assoc of School Resource Of?cers Basic Class 5/3/00 $790.00

2066 34 Ruth Muller interim City Clerk 5/3/00 $3,696.00

2067 25 Mr. T's Trophies "First Mayor" Plaque 5/3/00 $97.14

2068 16 Law Enforcement Equipment Flashlight w/Holster 5/3/00 $119.40

2069 4 Kustom Signals, lnc. Hand Held Radar Guns 5/3/00 $3,554.95
2071 9 King County Journal Newspapers Personnel Ads 5/3/00 $445.56

2072 5 Kenyon Law Firm Attorney Fees 5/3/00 $8,626.38

2073 23 lOS Capital Copy Machine Rental 5/3/00 $483.31

2074 13 lnca Preparation of CIP Presentation 5/3/00 $4,608.36

2075 3 GTE lnstall Jacks & Wire Phones 5/3/00 $57.79

2076 28 GFOA Publications for Accounting Mgr 5/3/00 $142.95

2077 20 Edaw Project #500 — Laurelwood - ElS 5/3/00 $12,000.00

2078 '10 Earth Tech Trans Planning & SEPA Mitigation 5/3/00 $1,950.00

2079 21 Dell Computer for CAD Tech 5/3/00 $1,845.58
2080 17 Daily Journal of Commerce Small Works Roster 5/3/00 $221.10

2081 6 Crystal Springs Water Delivery 5/3/00 $102.79

2082 19 Gordon Crandall Hearing Examiner Services 5/3/00 $862.70

2083 31 Corporate Express Office Supplies 5/3/00 $786.13

2084 1 Berryman & Henigar Plan Reviews 5/3/00 $16,131.00

2065 27 Bank of America Credit Card Charges 5/3/00 $412.71

2086 33 Association of WA Cities Labor Relations Institute for R. Baranzini 5/3/00 $120.00

2087 18 Air Touch Cellular Cell Phone 5/3/00 $29.70

2088 24 ADP Payroll Processing 5/3/00 $270.46

2089 30 McPherson Supply US. Flag 5/3/00 $80.22

TOTAL $79,510.86

AUTHORIZATION: CITY OF SAMMAMISH CERTIFICATION

l, the undersigned, do hereby certify under penalty of perjury, the materials have been furnished, the services rendered or the labor performed as described
herein, and the claim is a just and due obligation for the City of Sammamish. Furthermore, I certify l am authorized to authenticate payment of the claims.

SIGNATURE DATE





City of Sammamish
City Council Minutes

Regular Meeting
April 5, 2000

Mayor Jack Barry called the meeting to order at 7:35 p.m.

Councilmembers present: Mayor Jack Barry, Deputy Mayor Troy Romero,
Councilmembers Phil Dyer, Don Gerend, Ron Haworth, Kathleen Huckabay and
Kenneth Kilroy.

Staff present: City Manager Michael Wilson, City Attorney Bruce Disend,
AdministrativeServices Director Dennis Richards and Acting City Clerk Ruth Muller.

Student Liaisons: Jamie Furse, Skyline High School and Montsine Nshom, Eastlake
High School.

Roll Call/Pledge
Roll was called and Student Liaison Jamie Furse led the pledge.

Introduction of Special Guests and Presentations
Mayor Barry expressed appreciation for the extraordinary leadershipprovided by
Councilmember Phil Dyer during the di?icult time leading up to and immediately
following the City of Sammamish official incorporation on August 31, 1999. Mayor
Barry presented CouncilmemberDyer with a plaque in recognition of his service as the
City’s ?rst mayor for the period May 10, 1999 through January 26, 2000 on behalf of
himself,councilmembers,staff and the community.

CouncilmemberDyer, Chair of the Community Development Committee, welcomed
Parks and Recreation Commissioners Paul Brodeau, Karen Moran and John Rossi to this
meeting.

Approval of Agenda
Deputy Ma1o_r_Romeromoved for approval of the agenda. CouncilmemberDyer
seconded the motion. Councilmember Haworth moved to amend the agenda to add an
Executive Sessionprior to_a_c_lj9urmnentforpurpose o_f_propertyacquisitionand legal
matters. Councilmember Huckabay seconded the motion. The motion to amend carried
unanimously; The main motion as amended carried unanimously

Public Comment
Lisa Nolan, 21630 N. E. 11”‘Place, is speaking on behalf of the Margaret Mead
Elementary PTSA. The Tri—AwarenessCommittee conducted a survey of vehicles at the
intersectionof 216thAvenue Northeast and Northeast 16”‘Street during the morning and
afternoon times when children are going to and?romschool. This survey shows that
there are approximately 400 vehicles using the intersection at these times and the PTSA





is concerned about the increase in traffic with only children of the ages 10 and 11
performing traf?c crossing duties. There have been no adults volunteering to assist in
this tra?ic duty and the PTSA asks if there is anything that the City might do to help.
Mayor Barry advised that Police Chief Baranziniwill work with the PTSA to address this
issue.

Tom Harmon, 2302 West Beaver Lake Drive S. E., requested the Council continue work
towards obtaining a government television charmelfor the City. He also urged that the
City consider doing concurrency studies on the new units that willbe built as a result of
the “pipeline” permits approved by King County.

Consent Calendar Calendar
CouncilmemberHuckabay moved that the consent calendar be approved.
Councilmember Kilroy seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously approving
(a) Claims for the__periodending March 30, 2000 in amount of $l34,285.29;§b) Payroll
for theperiod March 1-15, 2000 in amount of $35,724.56; (_c_)Minutes of Public Hearing
on February9, 2000;_(pl).Joy Luck SubdivisionPlat Approval;and (e) Proclamation for
“Friends of the Library Week”.

New Business
Boys and Girls Club Presentation: Tim Blaylock, Executive Director of
Redmond/Kirkland/Northlakearea, and Loren Styboldt, President of the Sammarnish
club, reviewed plans that the Club has for youth in the Sarnmamisharea and the three
phases for construction of facilities to service the Sammamishcommunity.
Councilmembersand Student Liaisons expressed enthusiasm for these exciting plans for
the Sammamish community. Mr. Stayboldt announced that the SamrnamishClub has
received approval for hosting the National Invitational Girls Basketball Tournament to be
held the week between Christmas and New Year 2000. The Club is receiving good
support from the business community for this event.

Contract C2000—44: CouncilmemberDyer moved that Contract C2000—44for license
agreement and maintenance_agreement with Springbrook Software, Inc. for ?nancial
so?ware be approved and the City Manager be authorized to execute the agreements.
CouncilmemberHaworth seconded the motion. City Manager Wilson reviewed the
process that the City has taken to secure a ?nancial software package that willmeet the
needs of the comprehensive?nancial systems that the City manages. Councilmembers
questioned sections of the agreement relating to indemni?cationand warranty.
CouncilmemberDyer moved to amend the motion that approval is subject to (a)

veri?cation of user code availabilityand security, (b) con?rmationof fee schedule
limitations, to) integration of mutual hold harmless clau_s§,_a_nd (d)_speci?cs of the
warranty meet the satisfaction of the City Manager. Deputy Mayor Romero seconded the
motion. The motion to amend carried unanimously.

Deputy Mayor Romero moved to amend the motion that Schedule of Payment Terms for
license fees are to be 50% due at contract signing, and 50% due ninety (90) days from
date of contract signing,_b1_1tgivingtheCity Manager discretion to negotiate anywhere





from 50% to 100% of the up—frontlicense fee payment. CouncilmemberKilroyseconded
the motion. The motion to amend failedwith two aye votes: Romero and Kilroy; three
nay votes: Barry, Haworth and Huckabay; and two abstentions: Dyer and Gerend.

The main motion as amended carried unanimously.

Mayor Barry recessed the meeting at 8:55 p.m..for ?ve minutes.

The meeting reconvened at 9:05 p.m.

Resolution No. R2000-42:: City Manager Wilson said that this proposed new
investmentpolicy was reviewed by the Council at the April 12, 2000 Study Session and
willprovide the City ability for sufficient investments to meet the City’s investment
prioritiesof safety, liquidityand yield. CouncilmemberHuckabay moved that Resolution
No. R2000—42be adopted providing for Investment of City funds. Councilmember
Haworth seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.

Resolution No. R2000-43: City Manager Wilson said that these proposed personnel
policies were reviewed by the Council at the April 12, 2000 Study Session and have been
expanded over the interimpolicies to adequately cover all policies required to guide
employee conduct and performance. CouncilmemberHaworth moved that Resolution
No. R2000-43 be approved Adopting Personnel Policies and Repealing Resolution No.
R99-22. CouncilmemberHuckabay seconded the motion. The motion carried
unanimously.

Resolution No. R2000—44: City Manager Wilson said that this proposed newsletter
policy incorporates changes requested by the Council at the April 12, 2000 Study Session
and has been reviewed by the Finance Committee, who have recommended approval.
CouncilmemberHuckabay moved that Resolution No. R2000-44 be approved Adopting;

.

Newsletter Policy. Councilmember Kilroy seconded the motion. The motion carried
unanimously.

Council and Committee Reports
Jamie Furse reported that Skyline High School recently had a Spring Spirit Week and the
Fire Department conducted a simulationof a tra?ic accident that was very powerful.

Councilmember Gerend reported that the Community Safety Fair will be held April 29
from 10:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m. at Eastlake High School.

Councilmember Dyer reported that the Community Development Committee will hear
several hardship exemption cases on April 11 and work on the City vision statement, as
well as plan for community involvement in the development of the City Comprehensive
Plan.

Councilmember Huckabay expressed appreciation for the quarterly ?nancial report,
noting lower than expected revenues in several areas.





Mayor Barry reported on his attendance at a meeting with the County Executive, two
County Councilmembersand mayors of Redmondand Issaquah on the Eastside Trail. He
noted that it is still evident that there is the feelingthat the City of Samrnamish is not in
favor of the Trail even though we have stated our support in an adopted resolution. The
City may not have any say on the question of whether the Interim Trail will be closed for
use by the public.

City Manager and Staff Reports
Director of AdministrativeServices Richards reported on several staff positions that have
been ?lled and positions that are still advertised for hiring in the near future.

Special Project Planner Mathesreported on several projects in work in the Community
DevelopmentDepartment.

Chief Baranzini reported that Steve Thompson has been announced as the new Director
of King County Department of Detention. The Emergency Preparedness Advisory
Committee will meet April 20 at 1:30 p.m. with informationpresented about earthquakes
from a Universityof Washington SeismicLaboratory representative.

City Manager Wilson reportedthat several City o?icials will travel to Sherwood, Oregon
on April 8 to learn about the partnership between that City and the YMCA.

Public Comments
Marcia Rundle, 15639 S. E. 43rd,Bellevue, speaking on behalf of her son who lives on
East Lake Samrnamish Way thanked the mayor for his meeting with County officials on
the Trail issue and said that property owners wish to continue to work towards a
partnership to get a safe trail and access by citizens.

Carl Leist, 4170 212thWay S.E., expressed concerns about illegal tree cutting in his
neighborhood, noting that developers may see a window of opportunity in the transition
of code enforcement activities between King County and the City.

Vicky Bagette, 23903 N. E. 14”‘Street, questions how the citizens would be involved in
putting together the City’s comprehensive plan. CouncilmemberDyer provided
information on the process the City will conduct to assure citizen involvement in this plan
development.

There being no further business, Mayor Barry recessed the meeting for ?ve minutes at
9:45 p.m

The meeting reconvened at 9:55 p.m.

The Hearing on Appeal of Hearing ExaminerDecision, Crosswater Plat continued from
March 29, 2000 was opened.

The Appeal Hearing closed at 12:18 a.m.





Mayor Barry announced that the Council would recess to Executive Session for
approximately 20 minutes to discuss land acquisitionand litigation.

The meeting reconvened from Executive Session at 12:28 p.m.

Deputy Mayor Romero moved that the meeting adjourn. Councilmember Dyer seconded
the motion. The motion carried unanimously and the meeting adjourned at 12:30 p.m.

Ruth Muller, Acting City Clerk Mayor Jack Barry





Bill No. O2000—58

AGENDA BILL

CITY OF SAMMAMISH
CITY COUNCIL

Subject: Meeting Date May 3, 2000 Date Submitted April26, 2000
Penalties for Fire Lane Violations

Department Originating Police

Clearances:

X Adrninistration/Finance X Police

Action Required: Public Works Fire
Approve ordinance ‘

Building/Planning Attorney

Committee

Exhibits:
k
Amount
Budgeted:

Summary"’Statement:
Since the adoption of Ordinance No. 099-15 establishing provisions for various building codes for the City of
Sammarnish,it has come to the attention of staff, that there should be a provision for penalties for ?re lane violations
includedin this code. An amendmentto the building code ordinance has been prepared adding a new section providing
that any violation of the section relating to ?re lanes shall be punishable in accordance with provisions of the
SamrnarnishCriminalCode.

Recommended Motion:
Move to approve Ordinance No. 02000-58 Amending Section 14 of the Samrnarnish Building Code to Reference
Penalties for Fire Lane Violations.





CITY OF SAMMAMISH
WASHINGTON

ORDINANCE No. 02000-gf?

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SAMMAMISH,
WASHINGTON, AMENDING SECTION 14 OF THE
SAMMAMISH BUILDING CODE AND CREATING A NEW
SUBSECTION TO REFERENCE PENALTIES FOR FIRE
LANE VIOLATIONS

WHEREAS, the City Council adopted Ordinance No. 099-15 which created a Building
Code; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to amend the Building Code to reference penalties for
?re lane violations, Section 14 of the Building Code;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAMMAMISH,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 14110) of the Building Code Amended. Section l4(lO) of the
Sammamish Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

10. The Police Department, 5I3he—FireChief, Fire Marshal and other such personnel of
the Fire Department as designated by the Fire Chief and approved by the City Manager, shall have
the authority to issue infractions for violations of the Uniform Fire Code on forms provided by the
Chief of Police for such purposes.

A

Section 2. New Section 14111) of the Building Code Created. A new Section 14(1l) of the
Sammamish Building Code is hereby created to read as follows:

11. Any violation of this Section shall be punishable in accordance with the provisions
of Section 39(2) of the Sammamish Criminal Code.

Section 3. Severability. Should any section, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase of this
Ordinance, or its application to any person or circumstance, be declared unconstitutional or
otherwise invalid for any reason, or should any portion of this Ordinance be pre—ernptedby state or
federal law or regulation, such decision or pre—emptionshall not affect the validity of the remaining
portions of this Ordinance or its application to other persons or circumstances.

Section 4. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be published in the official newspaper of
the City, and shall take effect and be in ?ill force ?ve (5) days after the date of publication.

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL AT A REGULAR MEETING THEREOF ON
THE DAY OF , 2000.

F:\APPS\Sammam\ords\?rev|ol.doc



CITY OF SAMMAMISH

MayorJack Barry

ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:

Ruth Muller, Interim City Clerk

Approved as to form:

Bruce L. Disend, City Attorney

Filed with the City Clerk: /1);»; I $6’ :1 000
Passed by the City Council:
OrdinanceNo. 0 $1009 ...58
Date of Publication:

F:\APPS\Sammam\ords\?revloI.doc



/“\‘

I3

ORDINANCE NUMBERQ37-—/5’

AN ORDINANCEOF THE CITY OF SAMMAMISH, WASHINGTON,

RELATING TO BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION;

ESTABLISHING PROVISIONS FOR A BUILDING CODE, A MECHANICAL

CODE, AN ELECTRICALCODE, THEUNIFORMPLUIVIBINGCODE, A SIGN

CONSTRUCTIONCODE, A DANGEROUS BUILDINGCODE AND A FIRE CODE.

WHEREAS,the Washington State register directscitiesto enforce the State Building

Code, in accordancewith Chapter 19.29 RCW; and

WHEREAS,the Cityof Samrnamishwillincorporate on August 31, 1999; and

WHEREAS, the proceduresand requirementsfor buildingsand constructionin the City of

Sammamishare currently governedby KingCounty; and '

"

WHEREAS, the City Council?nds that it is in the bestinterestofthepublichealth, safety,

and generalwelfare to establishcomprehensive,uniform, and current proceduresand

requirementsfor constructionand maintenanceof buildingswithinthe City of Sammamish,NOW,

THEREFORE

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF S SH, WASHINGTON, DO

ORDAINAS FOLLOWS:
'

Section1.

may be citedas such.
Short Title. This ordinanceshallconstitutethe city "BuildingCode" and

Section2. P_umose. The purposeof the codesand regulationsadopted by this Title is

to regulatebuildings andconstructionwithinthe City and to producethe publichealth, safety and

welfare of the generalpublic,and not to create or otherwiseestablishor designate any particularll

class or group of personswho will or shouldbe especiallyprotectedby the term of these codes

and regulations. ‘

Section3. Adoptionof the UniformBuilding Code.The Uniform BuildingCode

(UBC), 1997edition,Volumes 1, 2, and 3, includingChapters 9, 11, IS, 16, 18, 19, 31-1, 31-11,

31-111,33, 34-1, and 34411,of the Appendixas publishedby the InternationalConferenceof

BuildingO?cials adoptedby the State of Washington pursuant to Chapters 51-30 WAC, are

adopted by reference, subjectthe the amendmentsset forth in this ordinance and includes the

saxn-code
s:mm«ordbct‘c 7-I4-99



page 2

Washington State amendmentsto the UniformBuildingCode (U.B.C.) 1997 editionunder the

directionof the Washington State BuildingCode Council, adopted pursuant to Chapter 19.27

RCW, and publishedin the Washington AdministrationCode as Chapter 51-04 WAC.

Section4. UniformBuilding Code- Section 109.1 amended- Useand Occugancv.

Section 109.1 of the Uniform Building Code, as adoptedby Section 3 of this ordinance, is

deemedamendedto read as follows:

109.1 Use and Occugangy. No buildingor structure shallbe used or occupied, and no

changein the existingoccupancy classi?cationof a buildingor structure or portion thereof

shallbe madeuntil the buildingo?icialhas issued a certi?cate of occupancy therefore as

providedherein.
Exception:

A

Group U Occupancies

Section5. Uniform BuildingCode - Section 110 added - Hours of Construction.

Section 110 of the UniformBuildingCode, as adoptedby section3 of this ordinance,is deemed

added and to read as follows:

110 Hoursof Coggruction.

. 110.1 Hours of Construction. Except as otherwiseprovided in this ordinance,the

activitiesand constructionnoise regulatedby this ordinanceshallbe limitedto the

following hours:

(1) Monday through Fridays 7 a.m. to 8 pm.

(2) Saturdays and Holidays 9 am. to 6 pm.

(3) Sundays No construction

Section6. UniformBuildingCode - Section310.2.2amended - ConstructionHeight

and Allowableareas. Section310.2.2 of the UniformBuilding Code, as adopted by Section3 of

this ordinance, is deemedamendedto read as follows: ‘

310.2.2 SpecialProvisions.gNotwithstandingotherprovisionsof this code, Group

R Division1 occupanciesshallnot be lessthan one hour ?re resistanceconstruction
throughout. Exterior balconiesextendingbeyond the ?oor area as de?nedby Section203

shallbe constructedof noncombustiblematerialsor as combustibleone—hourfire resistant

occupanciesseparationbetween units.

sum-code
sunm-otdbcfc 7-I4-99



page 3

Storage or laundry rooms that are withinGroup R Division1 occupancies that are

used in common by tenants shallbe separatedfrom the rest of the building by not

less that one-hour ?re resistant occupancy separation.

For Group R Division 1 occupancies witha Group S Division4 parking garage in

the basementor first ?oor, see Section311.2.2.2.

For atticspace partitions and dra? stops, see Section708.3.

Exteriorand interiordoors and windowsopeningonto a common corridor,

stairway, or similararea serving 5 or more dwellingunits shallbe protected as

speci?edin Section1005.

Section7. S§_ct_ion904.22 Allgocupangjesexcep_tGroup R Division3, and Group U

Occupancies. Section904.22 of the UniformBuildingCode, as adoptedby Section 3 of this

ordinance, is deemedamendedto read as follows:

904.22 Alloccupanciesexcept Group U occupancies.Exceptfor Group U occupancies,

an automaticsprinklersystem shallbe installed:

5. Throughoutallbuildings of three storiesor more in height except Group R, Division3.

Forthe purposeof this section a ?oor shallbe any levelof a buildingthat is occupiedfor

any reason.

6. Throughout allbuildingswhere the total floor area, includingbasements, exceeds

6,000 square feet. For the purposes of this section,portionsof buildings separated by

one or more area separation wallswillnot be considereda separate building.Existing

buildingsshallcomplywith this sectionwhen an additionis made to the buildingand

the total?oor area, includingthe basements, or the existingbuilding and the addition

combinedexceeds6,000 square feet,or whenthe value of the structure alterationor

repairof an existing building exceeds'SOper cent of the recognizedreplacementcost of

the structure, without considerationof the depreciation,as determinedunder The

MarshallValuationServiceCost Handbook,whicheveris greater.

7. Throughout every condominium,apartment house, hotel or motel three stories in

heightor containing10:01’more dwellingunits or guest rooms and every congregate

residencetwo or more stories inheightor havingan occupant load of 10 or more. For the

amnwsasn?vrfc 7-} 4-99



page 4

purpose of this sectionany ?oor that is occupied for any reason is considereda story and
portions of buildingsseparated by one or more separation walls will not be considereda
separate building.Residentialor quickresponse standard sprinklersshallbe used in the
dwellingand guest portions of the building.

Section8. UniformBuilding Code - Section 1804.7 amended - Draiggge. Section
1804.7 of the UniformBuilding Code as adopted in Section3 of this ordinance,is deemed
amendedas follows:

1804.7 Drainage.Provisionsshallbe made for the controlanddrainageof water around
and underbuildings(Also see Section 18064.5).
Adequate provisionsshallbe made to insurethat under?oor spaces remainfree of running
or standingwater by the installationof drains.As a minimum,such drains shallbe installed
aroundthe perimeterof the buildingat the footings.Additionaldrainsare requiredin
foundationsto relievewater ?'ornunder ?oor spaces where it is determinedby the
BuildingO?cial that such drainageis required.Drainpipesshallbe of su?cient size
to adequatelyconvey water to an approved location,but shallbe a minimumsizeof 4
inches.Provisionsshall be made to prevent the drainage system from becomingblocked.

Section9. LlniformBuilding Code - AppendixSection 3312.1 - Cuts. Section3312.1 in
the Appendixof the UniformBuildingCode, as adopted by Section 3 of this ordinance,is
amendedas follows:

3312.1 General. Unlessotherwiserecommended in the approvedsoils
engineeringor engineeringgeologyreport, cuts shallconformto the provision of
this section.

If walls or rockeriesare neededfor retainingcuts or ?lls or supporting
buildings,‘a civilengineeror soilsengineermust approve the design of the wall or
rockery if required by the BuildingOt?cial. Allrockeriesand walls shallhave a
drain systems as requiredfor foundations. .

In the absenceof an approvedsoilsengineeringreport, the provisionsmay
be waivedfor minor cuts if in the opinionof the BuildingO?icial there would not
be an erosionproblem.

Section 10. Adoptionof the UniformMechanicalCgde. The Uniform Mechanical
Code (UMC), 1997 edition,includingAppendixB, Chapter 13 and the UniformMechanicalCode

sam-code
sarmn-ordhcfc 7-14-99



Ixnp-‘I’-'3~

page 5

Standards, 1997 edition, publishedby the InternationalConferenceof Building O?icials and

adopted by the State of Washington pursuant to Chapter 51-32 WAC, are adopted by reference,

subject to amendmentset forth in this ordinance.

Section ll. Unifgrm Mechanicpl Cpde - Sectipn l3 l2.l8 added, A new section is

added to the UniformMechanicalCode as adopted in Section8 of this ordinance, as follows:

1312.18 Earthquake Shut off valve. All new gas servicesand gas serviceswhichare

expandedshallhave an approved earthquakeshut o?‘valve installedin the buildingsupply

line immediatelyafter the gas meter.The valve shallbe locatedoutside of the structure

and be accessible.

Section 12. Adoptionof the QniformFire Code . The UniformFire Code (UFC):
Volumes 1 and 2, 1997edition, includingAppendixLA, LC, II-A, II-B, ILC, II-E, II-G, II~H,

III-A, III-B, HI-D, IV-B, V-A, VI-A, VI—B,and VI-E as publishedby the International FireCode

Instituteand by the InternationalConferenceofBuilding Officialsand the Western Fire Chiefs

Associationand as adoptedby the State of Washington pursuant to Chapters 51-34 and 51-35

WAC, are adopted by reference, subject to the amendmentsset forth by this ordinance.

Section13. UniformFire Code - Section 105.3 amended- Applicationfpr Eermit.
Section 105.3of the UniformFire Code as adoptedby Section12 of this ordinance, is amended

as follows:

105.3 Applicationfor Permit. Applicationsfor permitsshallbe made to the City of

Sammarnishin suchform and detailas requiredby the ?re department.Applicationsfor

permitsshallbe accompaniedby suchplansas requiredby the Bureau of FirePrevention.

Allapplicationsfor ?re departmentpermitsshallbe forwardedto the Bureau of Fire

Preventionfor considerationof approval.

1053.1 Permit Fees. Any fees for?re code permits,plans check, or anyother ?re

serviceshallbe listedin the City of Sammamishfee ordinance.

105.3.2 Fire Code PermitTerm. Fire Code Permitsare either temporary,

pertainingto an activity or processthat willlast a speci?cperiodof time, usuallyless than

30 days, or annual.Allannualpermitswillexpire one year from the date of issuance.

samm-ordbcfc 7-14-99

T'Tt‘\‘T’S7’\"\ /*4 Y'V(\‘V‘\V1sf\iIvvV ..«\»~ /\r\r\YV' ..r,\,...a_..,- ..



9 rs -

page 6

Section 14. [Jniforrn Fire Code - Section904.42 gended - Fire apparatus access
roads. Section 901.42 of the UniformFire Code, as adopted in Section 12 of this ordinance,is
amended as follows: '

901.42 Fire apparatus access roads. When requiredby the Chief,approved signs
or other approved notices shallbe providedand maintainedfor ?re apparatus roads to
identify such roads and prohibit the obstructionthereof or both.

1.

sam-code

Alldesignated?re lanesshallbe clearlymarkedby the property owner in the
followingmanner: Vertical curbs shallbe paintedsix (6") inchesin heightand
shallbe paintedred on the top and side,extendingthe lengthof the designated?re
lanewith four inch(4") whiteblock lettering stenciledon the face "NO ..
PARKING- FIRE LANE".The stencilingshallbe spaced every ?fty feet (50‘).
Rolledcurbs or surfaceswithoutcurbs shallhave a six inch(6") wide stripe
paintedextendingthe lengthof the designated?re lanewith four inch (4") white
block letteringstenciledon the stripe "NO PARKING~ FIRE LANE.The
stencilingshallbe spaced every ?fty feet (50').

Signsmay be substitutedfor curb painting whenapproved in writingby the ?re
marshal

Signsshallbe not less than eighteeninches08") in heightby twelve inches(l2")
in width,with block letteringof not lessthanthree inches(3") high brush stroke,
reading: "NOPARKING- FlRELANE‘.Suchsignsshallbe reflectiveinnature,
withred letteringon a white background,and spaced at intervalsof not lessthan
??y feet (50') apart. The top of such signs shallnot be less than four feet (4‘),
nor more than six feet (6') ?ornthe ground. Signsmay be placedon buildings
when approved in writingby the ?re marshal.When posts arerequired,they shall
be constructed of eithertwo inch(2") or greater galvanizedsteel, or four inchby
four inch (4" x 4") or greater pressure treated wood. .
The?re marshalmay approvedeviationsfromany of the speci?cations when
approved in writingby the tire marshal.

S

Existingsigns may be allowedto remainuntilthe ?re marshaldeterminesthat a
need for replacement existsbasedon the legibilityor other deteriorationof the

samm-ordbc?: 7-l4-99

'v‘rr\'v‘«~o\m re .. ,,.a............-a,e .’\
...,....



onn?h

page 7

10.

Section 15.‘

existingsigns. Such replacementshalloccur within30 days of receivingwritten
noti?cation of the de?ciency.

V

Fire lanesshallbe establishedand maintainedas o?en as required by the ?re
marshalto clearly identifythe designatedarea as a ?re lane, at the sole expense of
the property owner. The property owner shallhavecompleted the required
establishmentor maintenanceof ?re laneswithin30 days of receivingwritten
noti?cationthat such is necessary.

At the entrance to the property where?re laneshave been designated, signs shall
be posted in a clearly conspicuouslocation,and shallclearlystate that vehicles
padcedin?re lanes may be impounded,and the name, telephone number, and
addressof the towing ?rm wherethe vehiclemay be redeemed. "

The owner, manager, or person in charge of any property upon whichany
designed?re lane has beenestablishedshallbe responsibleto prevent the
parkingof vehiclesin such?re lanesby informingthe appropriate towing
company of the violation.Ifthelaneis blockedby any other obstructions,the
owner, managed or person inchargeof the property shall attempt to remove the
obstruction,and if unable, shallinform the ?re department that the obstruction
exists.

Allcriminalviolationsof the UniformFire Code and obstruction of a ?re
apparatus road may be enforcedby any regular or reserve police o?cer of the
PoliceDepartment.

TheFireChief,Fire Marshaland suchother personnel of the Fire Department
as designatedby the FireChiefand approvedby the City Manager, shallhave
the authority to issue infractionsfor violationsof the Uniform FireCode on
forms providedby the ChiefofPolicefor suchpurposes.

A

ide ti?cation-l.4_4 amended - Pr
Section90l.4.4 of the UniformFire Code, as adoptedin Section12 of this ordinance,is amended
as follows:

sam-code

90l.4.4 Premisesidenti?cationApprovednumbersor addresses shallbe provided

samm-ordbcfc7-14-99

UOT’]‘F?’1Q nszrnmmnmc ?C’\\I /TRHQRZQH7 VVJ 7T7ZTT KTHW 00//Z/90



(‘?? 1-:

page 8

for allnew and existingbuildingsin sucha positionas to be plainlyvisibleand legible?om
the street or road fronting the property. Allnumbers and/or lettersshallbe no less than4
incheswith a contrastingcolor background.The ?re marshalmay require largernumbers
where large complexesand/or buildingsare present, or whereotherwisenecessaryto
assurevisibility.

Section 16. QniforrnFire Code - Sgcg?on902.2-l.ladded- Fire gggaratus Access
Roads. Section902.2.1.1 of the UniformFire Code,as adopted in Section 12 of this ordinance,is
added as follows:

902.2.l.l SprinklersRequired.Fire Sprinklersare required in all buildingsthat are
servedby a primaryaccess road that is in excess of 15 per cent for more that 200 feet.
Section 17. [lnifgmn EireQgde - gegogs901.221, 901.42 and 202.2thzough

902.2.4.l - Fire _/_\_ggaratusAccess Roads in the QniforrnFire Code as adogtedby Section 12
of thisordinance,shall be retained by the Cig of Sammamish.

Section1003.2.2 of the UniformFire Code, as adoptedby Section12 of this ordinance,is
amendedas follows:

Section l003.2.2 Alloccupancies except Group U Occupancies.Exceptfor
GroupUOccupancies,an automaticsprinldersystem shallbe installed:

5. Throughout all buildingsthree or more stories in heightexcept GroupR,
Division3.. For the purpose of thissectiona ?oorshall be any levelof a
bu?ding that is occupied for any reason.

i

6. Throughoutall buildings,includingR, Division3, where the total floor area,
includingbasements,exceeds 6,000 square feet.For the purposes of this section,
portions of buildingsseparated by by one or more area separation wallswillnot be
considereda separate building.Existingbuildingsshallcomply withthis section
when an additionis madeto the buildingand the total ?oor area, includingthe
basements,or the existingbuildingand the additioncombined exceeds6,000
square feet, or when the valueof the structuralalterationor repair of an existing
building6,000 square feet inarea or greater exceeds 50 per cent of the recognized

mm-code
mum-otdbcfc 7-l4-99

TTOTWPWC TYQT?T‘!?l1?lW?C ?C’\\T 7T£!(\O£27()n'7 (3!)/I7/(‘H



OTOF/31

page 9

replacementcost of the structure, withoutconsiderationof depreciation,as
determinedunder The MarshallValuationServiceCost Handbook,whicheveris
greater.

Section 19. Section10032.2Group3, Division1 Occupancies.GroupR, Division1
Occupanciesof the UniformFire Code,as adoptedby Section12of thisordinance,is amended as
follows:

Section 10032.9 GroupR, Division1 Occupancies. An automatic sprinkler
system shallbe installedthroughoutevery every condominium,apartment house,
hotel or motel three storiesin heightor containing10 or more dwellingunits or
guest rooms and every congregate residencetwo or more stories in height or
havingan occupant loadof 10 or more. For thepurpose of this sectionany ?oor
that isoccupiedfor any reason is considereda story and portions of buildings=<'

separatedby one or moreseparationwallswillnot be considereda separate
Residentialor quick responsestandardsprinklers shallbe used in the

dwellingand guest room portionsof the building.
'

Section .20. Section 1007 Fire AlarmSystems - General. Section l007.2,l.3 of the
UniformFire Code, as adopted by Section 12 of thisordinance,is amendedwith the additionas
follows:

Section 1007.2.1.3Monitoredautomaticfirealarm systems are required in:
A. Buildingsof all occupanciesexcept R3 andU shallbe equippedwithan
approvedmonitoredautomaticthe alarmsystem at the time of constructionwhen
remodelingis in excess of??y percent (50%) of the accessed value or when the
uses change to a more hazardoususe, as determinedby the Fire Chief.Exception:
An alarmneed not be installedinmultipleresidencedwellings,hotelsor motels
constructed all on one floorwhenindividualdwellingor guest units are separated
by at least one hour ?re resistantseparationsand each unit has a direct exit to a
yard or publicway, nor in retailor commercialoccupancieswith a ?oor area less
than three thousand(3,000) squarefeet.Provided,that any buildingwhich‘has
installedan approved sprinklersystem whereinthe sprinlrlersystem and control
valve have been equippedto automaticallytransmitan alarm by approved means to
the ?re department,willnot be requiredto complywith the requirement for
installationof an approved and maintained?re protection system under this
section.

samm-ordbcfc7-14-99

U0T']IP.1<2 Usrumunimc neon /TmmR7on'7 vvd as-TT «mm ??/I7/("0



page 10

B. 1. Alloccupancies to which this chapterappliesexceeding3,000 square feet
gross ?oor area, except GroupR, Division3 and U occupancies, shall be required
to provide an approved monitoredautomatic ?re detection system, and
occupanciesprotected throughan approved monitoredsprinklersystem may
utilizea ?re detection system withoutheat detectors.

2. A monitored?re detectionsystem shallmeet the followingrequirements:
a The system shallbe supervised and UL approved;
b. The system shallhaveduallines;
c. The system shallhavea data test signalorbe tinesupervised;and
d. Tape recorders shallnotbe utilized.

Section 21. Section 11023.1 Open Burning - General.Section11023.1 of the
UniformFire Code, as adoptedby Section12 of this ordinance,is amendedas follows:

Section 11023.1 General.Openingburning shallnot be conducted at anytime in
compliancewith a permanent ban on open burningestablishedby the Puget Sound
PollutionControl Agencyin September of 1992.

Exception:Barbecueand other cooking ?res in accordancewith
Section 1102.4 andsection1102.5.

.Section22. Section 7701.7 .2 - amended - Limitsestablishedby law. Section7701.72
of the Uniform Fire Code, as adoptedby section12 of this ordinance,is amended as follows:

b

Section7701.7.2 Limitsas establishedby law. The storage of explosive
5 materialsis prohibitedwithinthe limitsof the City.

.3‘

Section23. Section7801.311 - amended- Manufacturing.Section 7801.3.1.1of the
'

Uniform Fire Code, as adopted by Section12 of thisordinance,is amendedas follows:

Section7801.3.] .1Manufacturing.The manufacturingof ?reworks is prohibited
withinthe limitsof the City. "

Section 24. Section 7902.221 and Section 7904.2.5.4.2 amended - Locations where
above ground tanks are prohibited. Section7902.221 and Section7904.2.S.4.2 of the Uniform
Fire Code, as adoptedby Section 12 of thisordinance,are amendedas follows:

mmuHmbm:7d¢%

Tfnmy UOT1P1C nsrmnmmnc nc?v ITnnon7on7 vva ???TT



page 11

Section7902.2.2.l Locationswhereaboveground tanks are prohibited. The
storage of Class I and Class II ?ammable liquidsin above ground tanks in excess
of 100 gallons is prohibited withinthe limitsof the City.

Section 7904.2.5.4.2 Locationswhere aboveground tanks are prohibited. The
storage of Class I and Class II ?ammable liquidsin above ground tanks in excess
of 100 gallons is prohibited withinthe limitsof the City.

Section25. Section 8204.2 - amended- Maximumcapacig withinEstablishedLimits.
’ Section8204.2 of the UnifortnFire Code, as adoptedby Section12 of this ordinanceis amended
as follows:

Section 8204.2 Maximumcapacitywithinestablishedlimits. The aggregate
T

capacityof any one installationshallnot exceed2,000 gallons water capacity,
except that in particular installationsthis capacitylimitmay be altered at the
discretionof the chiefafter considerationof specialfeaturessuch as
topographical conditions,nature of the occupancy and proximityto buildings,
capacityof proposed tanks, degreeof private?re protection to be provided, and
facilitiesof the ?re department

Section26. Adoption of the UniformPlumbingCode. TheUniform PlumbingCode
(UPC), 1997 Edition, excludingchapter 12of theCode, includingChapters A, B, D, and H of the
Appendicesand the UniformPlumbingStandards,1997 Edition,as published by the InternationalI

,~-AssociationofPlumbingand MechanicalO?cials, as adoptedby the State of Washington
pursuant to Chapter 51-27 WAC, are adoptedby reference.

. Section27. UniformPlumbingCode - Table1-1 - PlumbingPermit Fees. Table 1-1 of
the UniformPlumbingCode as adopted by Section22 of thisordinance,is herebydeleted.
Reference is made to theCity of SammarnishFee Ordinance.

5

Section28. Adoption of the UniformCode for the Abatementof Dangerous Buildings.

The Uniform Code for the Abatementof Dangerous Buildings(UCADB), 1997 Edition,as
publishedby the InternationalConferenceof BuildingO?icials, is adopted by reference.

sun-code
c 7- l4-99

7Tnl?>‘i
I

UOT’]¥?1Q nsrmmvmmc ncrw ITR(\OFZ‘70?7 vvq (‘f¥1TTT unm nn/:7/en



cram:

page 12

Section29. Adoption of the UniformHousing Code. The UniformHousing Code
(UHC), 1997 Edition, as published by the InternationalConferenceof BuildingO?icials, is
adopted by reference.

Section 30. Adoption ofthe UniformBuildingSecurityCode. The UniformBuilding
SecurityCode (USBC), 1997 Edition,as publishedby the InternationalConferenceof Building
Officials,is adopted by reference.

Section31. Adoptionof the ElectricalCode. The followingcodes are adopted by
reference. A

A. The NationalElectricalCode, 1999 Edition,as published by the National
Fire ProtectionAssociation;and is

B. Laws, Rules and Regulationsfor InstallingElectricWiringand Equipment,
issued by the ElectricalBoard pursuant toChapter 19.28 RCW as presently
existingand as may be subsequentlyamended: and

C. The followingChaptersof the Washington AdministrativeCode as
presently existing and as may be subsequentlyamended:

1. Chapter 296-42WAC - HeatingInstallations;
2. Chapter 29644 WAC - SafetyStandards— ElectricalConstruction
Code:
3. Chapter 29645 WAC - SafetyStandards- ElectricalWorkers;
4. Chapter296-46WAC -— Safety Standards- ElectricWiresand
Equipment;
5. Chapter 296~47WAC —- ElectricalWiringand Apparatus; and
6..Chapter 296-401 WAC - Certi?cation of Competencyfor Journey-
man Electricians.

L

Section 32. Adoption of Sig ConstructionCode. TheUniformSign Code (USC),
1997 Editionas publishedby the InternationalConferenceof BuildingO?icials, is adopted by
reference,subjectto the amendmentset forth in this ordinance.

ummhw?m? IUHW

norwnwc nqrmnmmnc ncov :Tnnon7on7 vva esvrr now (XIV/I7/(‘H



“$775 F7>‘T"”

page 13

Section33. nifonn Si e - Section210 arnende - Mar ee. Section210 ofthe
UniformSign Code, as adopted by Section27 of this ordinance,is amended as follows:

Section 210 Marquee. A marqueeis a permanent roofed structure attached to and
supported by the building,providingprotectionfromthe weather elements,but
does not includea projectingroof. For the purposes of this Chapter, a
freestandingpermanent roof-likestructure providingprotection fromthe weather
elements,such as a servicestationgas pump island,shallbe considereda marquee.

Section34. Adoption of AdditionalStateCodes.The followingChaptersof the
WashingtonAdministrativeCode, as presently existingand as‘ may be amended,are adopted by
reference:

A. Chapter 51-30WAC - Washington State Barrier FreeFacilitiesCode;

B. Chapter 51-11 WAC - Washington State EnergyCode;

C. Chapter 51-13 WAC - Washington State Ventilation and Indoor Air
QualityCode; and

D. Chapter 5 l—19WAC — Washington State Historic BuildingCode.

Section 35. CodeCon?ictg Resolution.

A In case of con?ict amongthe BuildingCode, theMechanicalCode,the Fire
Code, and the PlumbingCode, the ?rst named code shallgovern overthose
following. '

B. In case of con?ict betweenother codes and provisions adopted by this
ordinance,the code or provisionthat is the most restrictive,as determined
by the Building O?cial, shallapply.

Section36. Liabilig. Thisordinanceshallnot be construed to relieve or lessenthe
responsibilityof any person, partnership,?rm,association,or corporationowning,building,
altering,constructing, or moving any buildingor structure as de?nedin the buildingcode; nor
shallthe City or any o?cer, employee, or agent of the Cityassume such liabilityby reason of any

sam-code
samm-ort?acfc 7-l4-99

UOTWPWC UQTMPWNWC HCWV ITR?0R70?7 VVJ O?'TT nnw nn/:7/on



S ‘

39. ‘
- - . . . .ectlon E——-LV6 Data A 3”“-1m3IYOff-hisOrdlnanceconslstmg of Its txtleshallbepublished in the o?icial newspaperof the City. Thisordinanceshalltake e?fectand be in fun fon August 31, 1999

one

.ADOPTED BY ms CITYCOUNCILAT A REGULARMEETINGTHERETHE 315:DAY OF AUGUST1999.
OF ON

Approx/ed;as to form:

Filedwith the City c1erk:3‘a.L,.22.; 997
Passed by the City Council::52: I7 as,/9-77
OrdinanceNumber: 59 gay.- / 5’
Date of Publication:am,mg?‘ r/) 7947

sam-code
satmn-adbcfc 7-14-99

ovum
‘

V

nnT1n’vc neTmnnnvm(~ ncvxv rTc:nnc27nn7 ‘VVJ o?v'TT



Bill No. 02000-64

AGENDA BILL

CITY OF SAMMAMISH
CITY COUNCIL

Subject: Meeting Date May 3, 2000 Date Submitted April26, 2000
Penalties for Fire Lane Violations

Department Originating Police

Clearances:

X Adrninistration/Finance X Police

Action Required: Public Works Fire
Approve ordinance

Building/Planning Attorney

Committee

Exhibits:
j

Amount
Budgeted:

Summary Statement:
Sta?”has recommended that a new section be added to the building code ordinance providing that ?re lane violations
be punishablein accordance with provisions of the Sammamish Criminal Code. This proposed ordinance provides for
amendmentto the SammamishCriminalCode includingpenalties for ?re lane violations.

Recommended Motion:
Move to approve Ordinance No. 02000-64 Amending the Sammamish Criminal Code to Include Penalties for Fire
Lane Violations.





CITY OF SAMMAMISH
WASHINGTON

ORDINANCE No. 02000-Q7‘

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SAMMAMISH,
WASHINGTON, AMENDING THE SAMMANIISH
CRIMINAL CODE TO INCLUDE PENALTIES FOR FIRE
LANE VIOLATIONS

WHEREAS, the City Council adopted Ordinance No. 099-15 creating a Building Code; and

WHEREAS, the City Council adopted Ordinance No. 02000-52 creating a Criminal Code;
and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to amend the Criminal Code to include penalties for
fire lane violations, Section 14 of the Building Code;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAIVIIVIAMISH,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 39(2) of the Sammamish Criminal Code Amended. Section 39(2) of the
Sammamish Criminal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

2. The following provisions of the King County Code as presently constituted or
hereinafter amended are adopted by reference.

KCC l2.64.0 10 Unlawful - Determination (Loitering).
KCC l7.04.070( J 1 Violation — Civil infraction.
KCC 17.04.070gK1 Violation - Civil penalty.
KCC l7.04.070§L2 Impoundment.
KCC 28.96.0l0 Civil infractions - Misdemeanors.
KCC 28.96.020 General (Public Communications Activities).
KCC 28.96.030 Transit vehicles and tunnel platform areas.
KCC 28.96.410 General (Enforcement).
KCC 28.96.420 Immediate expulsion.
KCC 28.96.430 Suspension of use privileges.
KCC 28.96.440 Infractions ~ Penalty.
KCC 28.96.450 Misdemeanors — Penalty.

Section 2. Severability. Should any section, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase of this
Ordinance, or its application to any person or circumstance, be declared unconstitutional or
otherwise invalid for any reason, or should any portion of this Ordinance be pre—emptedby state or
federal law or regulation, such decision or pre—emptionshall not affect the validity of the remaining
portions of this Ordinance or its application to other persons or circumstances.

_ 1 _

F:\APPS\Sammam\ords\?re|ane.doc



Section 3. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be published in the official newspaper of
the City, and shall take effect and be in full force ?ve (5) days after the date of publication.

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL AT A REGULAR MEETING THEREOF ON
THE DAY OF , 2000.

CITY OF SAMMAMISH

Mayor Jack Barry

ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:

Ruth Muller, Interim City Clerk

Approved as to form:

Bruce L. Disend, City Attorney

Filed with the City Clerk: FlPm‘‘ 5‘ 4/ 100°

Passed by the City Council:
Ordinance No. ogaszy —— A'7’
Date of Publication:

F:\APPS\Sammam\ords\?relane.doc



FIRE CODE l7.04.020 ~ 17.04.07O

E. Fire department to King County fire marshal's office. (Ord. 12560 §

144, 1996: 0rd. 2097 § 2, 1974).

17.04.030 Section UFC l003.2.8. A new subsection is added to Section
lOO3.2.8 of the Uniform Fire Code as follows:

All senior citizen apartments defined as, a room or a suite of two or
more rooms in a duplex or multi—family structure for which occupancy of
the structure has been. limited. to persons age sixty—two or older by
covenant or deed restriction in which King County is granted enforcement
authority, which are four stories or more in height shall be protected
throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system.

(Ord. 12560 § 145, 1996: Ord. 6328 § 4, 1983).

17.04.04O UFC Table 7902.3-A. A new footnote is added to Table 7902.3—A
of the Uniform Fire Code as follows:

Outdoor storage of flammable liquids in excess of ten gallons is I10t
permitted on property used for R-1 and R-3 occupancies.

(Ord. 12560 § 146, 1996: Ord. 8726, 1988).

17.04.07O Fire lanes - Establishment — Vehicle obstruction and
impoundment. A. Establishment of Fire Lanes. Fire lanes in conformance with
this code shall be established. by the King County‘ fire marshal or his
authorized designee, and shall be referred to as designated fire lanes in this
section.

B. Definition of Fire Lanes. The area within any public right ~of—way,
easement, or on private property designated for the purpose of permitting fire
trucks and other fire fighting or emergency equipment to use, travel upon, and
park.

C. Marking of Fire Lanes. All designated fire lanes shall be clearly
marked in the following manner:

1. Vertical curbs KS inch) shall be painted yellow cni the tcm> and
side, extending the length of the designated fire lane. The pavement adjacent
to the painted curbs shall be marked with minimum 18 inch in height block
lettering with a Hdnimum 3 inch brush stroke readimg: "NO PARKING — FIRE
LANE." Lettering shall be yellow and spaced at 50 foot or portion thereof
intervals, or

2. Rolled curbs or surface without curbs shall have a yellow 6 inch
wide stripe painted extending the length of the designated fire lane. The-
surface adjacent to the stripe shall be marked with minimum 18 inch in height
block lettering with a minimum 3 inch brush stroke reading: "NO PARKING —

FIRE LANE." Lettering shall be in yellow and spaced at 50 ft. or portion
thereof intervals, or

3. Fire lane signs shall be installed per the illustration:

652-9 (King County 9-97)



l7.04.0'7O FIRE CODE

12"

Letter Specifications

18" N O
3" Height

3" Height
PARKING

2,, Height

FIRE 2" Height

LANE

a. Reflective in nature.

b. Red letters on white background.

c. Signs to be spaced 50 feet or portion thereof apart and posted on
or immediately next to the curb.

d. Top of signs to be not less than 4 feet nor more than 6 feet from
the ground.

e. Signs may be placed on a building when approved by the fire
marshal as the designee of the manager of the department of development and
environmental services.

When posts are required they shall be a minimum of 2 inch galvanized steel
or 4 inch x 4 inch pressure treated wood. Signs to be placed so they face the
direction of the vehicular travel.

D. Obstruction of Fire Lanes Prohibited. The obstruction of a
designated fire lane by a parked vehicle or any other object is prohibited,
shall constitute a traffic hazard as defined in state law and an immediate
hazard to life and property.

E. Alternate Materials and Methods. The fire marshal as designee of the
manager of the department of development and environmental services may modify
any of the provisions herein where practical difficulties exist. The
particulars of a modification shall be granted by the fire marshal and shall
be entered into the records of the office.

F. Existing fire lane signs and markings.
1. Signs (minimum 9 inch by 16 inch) may be allowed to remain until

there is a need for replacement and at that time a 12 inch x 18 inch sign
shall be installed.

2. Markings may be allowed to remain until there is a need for
repainting and at that time the provisions outlined in Section C, 1, 2 or 3
shall be complied with.

G. Maintenance. Fire lane markings shall be maintained at the expense
of the property owner(s) as often as needed to clearly identify the designated
area as being a fire lane.

H. Towing notification. At each entrance to property where fire lanes
have been designated, signs shall be posted in a clearly conspicuous location
and shall clearly state that vehicles parked in fire lanes may be impounded,
and the name, telephone number, and address of the towing firm where the
vehicle may be redeemed.

I. Property owner responsible. The owner, manager, or person in charge
of any property upon which designated fire lanes have been established shall
prevent the parking of vehicles or placement of other obstructions in such
fire lanes.

J. Violation - Civil infraction. Any person who fails to mark or
maintain the marking of a designated fire lane as prescribed in this chapter,



or who parks a vehicle in, allows the parking of a vehicle in, obstructs, or
allows the

(King County 9-97) 653



FIRE CODE 17.04.07O — 17.04.09O

obstruction of a designated fire lane commits a civil infraction to which the
provisions of RCW 7.80 shall apply. The penalty for failing to mark or
maintain the marking of a designated fire lane shall be one hundred and fifty
dollars. The penalty for parking a vehicle in, allowing the parking of a
vehicle in, obstructing, or allowing the obstruction of a designated fire lane
shall be fifty dollars.

K. Violation — Civil Penalty. In addition to, or as an alternate to,
the provisions of subsection E, any person who fails to meet the provisions of
the fire lane requirements codified in this title shall be subject to civil
penalties in conformance with K C.C. Chapter 23.

L. Impoundment. Any vehicle or object obstructing a designated fire
lane is hereby declared a traffic hazard and may be abated without prior
notification to its owner by impoundment pursuant to the applicable state law.
(Ord. 11783 § 1, 1995: 0rd. 8868, 1989: Ord. 7980 § 1, 1987).

17.04.080 Enforcement. A. The fire marshal or his authorized designee
is authorized to enforce the provisions of this chapter, the ordinances
codified in it, and any rules and regulations adopted thereunder pursuant to
the enforcement and penalty provisions of Title 23.

B. The fire marshal, or his authorized designee, any officer of the
department of public safety, and the chief of the fire district, or his
authorized designee, is authorized to take such lawful action, including the
writing and issuance of citations for civil infractions, as may be required to
enforce the provisions of the fire lane ordinance codified in this title.
(Ord. 11783 § 2, 1995: Ord. 7980 § 2, 1987: Ord. 2910 § 6, 1976: Ord. 2097
(part), 1974).

l7.04.090 Severability. If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence,
clause or phrase of this chapter is for any reason held to be invalid or
unconstitutional, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the
validity or constitutionality of the remaining portions of this chapter, it
being herein expressly declared that the ordinance codified in this chapter
and each section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause and phrase thereof
would have been adopted irrespective of the fact that any one or more other
sections, subsections, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases are declared
invalid or unconstitutional. (Ord. 2097 § 15, 1974).

653-1 (King County 9—97)


